
 

 

Conference Registration Cancellation Policy:  

Every attempt will be made to offer the conference program as publicized. However, the 
McKenzie Institute International (MII) reserves the right to adjust the program to 
accommodate unforeseen circumstances. Program changes that result in a date change will 
permit registrants to cancel with a full refund.  MII also reserves the right to postpone or 
cancel the conference due to insufficient enrolment or unforeseen circumstances up to 6 
months prior to the event.  If the conference is cancelled by the McKenzie Institute, a full 
refund will be provided to registrants. MII is not responsible for any travel expenses incurred 
by registrants due to such cancellations.  If you wish to make travel arrangements prior to 
the 6-month cancellation deadline, we recommend you choose rates that allow flexibility.    

Conference fees are processed at the time of registration. Once processed the fee paid is 
subject to cancellation penalties should the registrant subsequently cancel.  The cancellation 
penalty will increase the closer the cancellation request is made to the commencement of 
the conference.  For more details on the penalty stages associated with cancelling your 
registration, please see below.  

FROM PERIOD:  TO PERIOD:  PENALTY *  

(Amount of registration fee that is non-
refundable)  

      

Date of registration  March 31st, 2024  $150.00 USD  

From April 1st, 2024  May 31st, 2024  50% of registration fee  

From June 1st, 2024  July 7th, 2024  75% of registration fee  

From July 8th   Until August 8th  100% of registration fee  

From August 9th   Until end of conference  100% of registration fee  

*Course credits will not be provided in lieu of the cancellation penalty.  If you cancel, the 
difference between the registration fee paid and the penalty amount outlined above, will be 
refunded to the registrant.  

If you have questions regarding the cancellation policy, please contact Aileen Conway at 
mckenziecanadamdt@gmail.com  

By checking the box on the registration form I confirm I have read and understand the 
cancellation policy outlined above and agree to abide by the terms and conditions laid out in 
the policy.  I understand that financial commitments are being made by MII based on the 
conference registrations received and that cancelling after making the commitment to attend 
can adversely affect the conference budget.    
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